
Sunday Mass and more can be watched here:
St. Luke’s  https://twitter.com/saintlukesbull
Catholic Cathedral: Daily Masses will be live streamed from St John’s 
Cathedral every day at 10am.  You can watch all of these Masses 
at: www.sjbcathedral.org.uk
Walsingham  https://www.walsingham.org.uk/live-stream/
And also churchservices.tv has Masses from all over Britain and Ireland.

Those of you who remember Father Sean Connolly may like to know he is 
doing an Evening Prayer podcast every evening. You can listen between 
6pm-9pm. It’s about 10 minutes long and you can follow the text online:  
http://www.stgeorgenorwich.com/welcome

For those parishioners who are not 'silver surfers' and don't have the internet, 
the Cardinal has pointed to RTE in Ireland. They broadcast Sunday Mass on 
252 LongWave on the radio/wireless at 11am - occasionally it may be a 
service from another denomination - and will also broadcast the Holy Week 
and Feast Day Masses. 

If you have Sky, channel 588 is the EWTN Catholic channel. You will not 
need an internet connection to watch this, just a Sky box. EWTN is free to air 
so if you have a working Sky box you can watch it even if you don't subscribe 
to Sky anymore.

Dial A Mass opportunity: Telephone Sunday Mass from St Mary’s cathedral, 
Middlesborough is being offered by Middleborough diocese. The Mass is 
recorded at 12noon on Sunday and is available once it’s been uploaded so 
after 1pm is best. It is then available all week. The number to call is 01642 
130120. Calls are charged at local rate and free if in your included minutes. 
Rebecca tried it and you can hear it hands free with your speaker volume up 
so a couple can listen together.

Because there currently isn't  a hard copy of this information, please pass the 
details on to those who may be interested.
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